
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening:  December 21, 2010
DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time: 3:00 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: ___________________________

RECORDER: _______________________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

              IFB #2011-3112-4312
                 
          POOL CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

                                             

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6a 6b
1 Swim Kire 63.00$           2.38$               25.81$             125.64$        11.82$         5.53$               64.40$            
2 Dominion Chemical Company 65.00$           1.06$               20.00$             130.30$        -$             0.175 -$                
3 Harper and Company 55.34$           1.51$               15.00$             72.00$          8.00$           69.00$            19.57$            
4 Leslie's 47.99$           -$                20.99$             85.99$          9.99$           -$                -$                
5 Airgas -$               -$                -$                 -$              -$             -$                -$                

TALLY SHEET 1



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Swim Kire
2 Dominion Chemical Company
3 Harper and Company
4 Leslie's 
5 Airgas

7 8a 8b 8c 8d 8e 8f
16.15$             6.74$             6.74$             6.94$             4.43$             4.09$             4.13$             
15.50$             -$               -$               -$               -$               -$               -$               

-$                 6.71$             -$               -$               -$               -$               -$               
21.99$             5.99$             5.99$             5.99$             5.99$             5.99$             2.99$             

-$                 -$               -$               -$               -$               -$               -$               

TALLY SHEET 2



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Swim Kire
2 Dominion Chemical Company
3 Harper and Company
4 Leslie's 
5 Airgas

8g 8h 8i 8j 8k 9 10
4.13$             5.07$             7.28$             4.53$             3.71$             9.49$                  60.00$              
-$               -$               -$               -$               -$               -$                    -$                  
-$               -$               -$               -$               -$               6.00$                  75.00$              

5.99$             5.99$             3.99$             5.99$             5.99$             -$                    -$                  
-$               -$               -$               -$               -$               -$                    40.00$              

TALLY SHEET 3



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Swim Kire
2 Dominion Chemical Company
3 Harper and Company
4 Leslie's 
5 Airgas

11 12 13 14 15 TOTAL BID
0.63$               11.26$            74.25$            23.44$           -$                 
-$                -$                -$                15.75$           -$                 

0.60$               25.00$            30.00$            18.00$           221.36$            46,323.56$          
-$                12.49$            -$                26.99$           192.37$            

0.21$               -$                -$                -$               -$                 5,000.00$            

TALLY SHEET 4


