CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE

1757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

Bid Opening: June 8, 2010
Time: 3:00 P.M.

BUYER:

RECORDER:

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and

read aloud at the public bid opening.

IFB #2010-6530-2011

SIGN MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. $ 13275 | $ 199.13 | $ 265.50 | $ 13275 | $ 199.13 | $ 265.50
3M Company $ 207.00 | $ 31050 ( $ 414.00 | $ 207.00 | $ 31050 | $ 414.00
Garden State Highway Products $ 15947 | $ 239.21 | $ 31894 | $ 15947 | $ 239.21 | $ 318.94
Vulcan Signs $ 162.00 | $ 243.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 243.00 | $ 324.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 157.00 | $ 236.00 | $ 31400 | $ 157.00 | $ 236.00 | $ 314.00
Korman Signs $ 162.00 | $ 243.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 243.00 | $ 324.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE

1757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 10 11 12
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. $ 331.88 | $ 398.25 | $ 531.00 | $ 265.50 | $ 331.88 | $ 132.75
3M Company $ 51750 ( $ 621.00 | $ 828.00 | $ 414.00 | $ 51750 | $ 207.00
Garden State Highway Products $ 398.68 | $ 47842 | $ 637.89 | $ 318.94 | $ 398.68 | $ 159.47
Vulcan Signs $ 405.00 | $ 486.00 | $ 648.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 405.00 | $ 162.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 391.00 | $ 472.00 | $ 628.00 | $ 31400 | $ 391.00 | $ 157.00
Korman Signs $ 405.00 | $ 486.00 | $ 648.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 405.00 | $ 162.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE

1757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 13 14 15 16 17 18 19
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. $ 199.13 | $ 265.50 | $ 331.88 | $ 398.25 | $ 531.00 | $ 15750 | $ 236.25
3M Company $ 31050 | $ 414.00 | $ 51750 | $ 621.00 | $ 828.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 180.00
Garden State Highway Products $ 239.21 | $ 31894 | $ 398.68 | $ 478.42 | $ 63789 | $ 102.63 | $ 153.94
Vulcan Signs $ 243.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 405.00 | $ 486.00 | $ 648.00 | $ 102.00 | $ 153.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 236.00 | $ 31400 | $ 391.00 | $ 472.00 | $ 628.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 157.00
Korman Signs $ 243.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 405.00 | $ 486.00 | $ 648.00 | $ 116.00 | $ 173.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE

1757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 20 21 22 23 24 25
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. $ 315.00 | $ 630.00 | $ 2790 | $ 3720 | $ 55.80 | $ 74.40
3M Company $ 240.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 216.00
Garden State Highway Products $ 205.26 | $ 41052 | $ 85.26 | $ 11368 | $ 17052 | $ 227.36
Vulcan Signs $ 204.00 | $ 408.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 216.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 210.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 192.00
Korman Signs $ 231.00 | $ 462.00 | $ 79.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 158.00 | $ 210.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 26 27 28 29 30 31
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. $ 93.00 | $ 11160 | $ 133.99 | NB NB NB
3M Company $ 270.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 432.00 | $ 26181 ($ 39272 | $ 523.62
Garden State Highway Products $ 28421 | $ 341.05 | $ 45473 | $ 256.18 | $ 384.29 | $ 512.38
Vulcan Signs $ 270.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 432.00 | $ 294.00 | $ 441.00 | $ 588.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 240.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 384.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 1,305.00 | $ 1,740.00
Korman Signs $ 263.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 276.00 | $ 414.00 | $ 552.00

'Scooo\lcnm.poowr—\D

TALLY SHEET 5




CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 32 33 34 35 36 37
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 58.56 | $ 58.56 | $ 2532 | $ 2532 | $ 4220 | $ 54.81
Garden State Highway Products $ 1841 | $ 1841 | $ 1381 | $ 1381 | $ 23.02 | $ 28.77
Vulcan Signs $ 19.92 | $ 1992 | $ 15.12 | $ 1512 | $ 2520 | $ 31.50
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 29.06 | $ 29.06 | $ 1350 | $ 1350 | $ 22.00 | $ 27.18
Korman Signs $ 18.40 | $ 18.40 | $ 13.75 | $ 13.75 | $ 21.70 | $ 25.60
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:

FAX: 75

757.926.8721
7.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 38 39 40 41 42 43 44
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 5481 | $ 1462 | $ 1754 | $ 1754 | $ 5481 | $ 75.96 | $ 84.33
Garden State Highway Products $ 28.64 | $ 9.29 | $ 929 | $ 9.29 | $ 29.05 | $ 4124 | $ 41.24
Vulcan Signs $ 3150 (| $ 1022 | $ 1022 | $ 1022 | $ 3194 | $ 4536 | $ 46.76
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 27.18 | $ 9.10 | $ 9.10 | $ 9.10 | $ 2781 | $ 4050 | $ 57.05
Korman Signs $ 25.60 | $ 1230 | $ 1230 | $ 1230 | $ 3220 | $ 4180 | $ 48.70
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:

FAX: 75

757.926.8721
7.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 45 46 47 48 49 50 51
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 84.33 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06
Garden State Highway Products $ 4124 | $ 1.29|$% 1291 $ 1.29]$% 1291 $ 1291 $ 1.29
Vulcan Signs $ 46.76 | $ 2911$ 2911 $ 2911$ 2911 $ 2911 $ 291
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 57.05| $ 723 | % 723 |% 723 | % 723 |% 723 |% 7.23
Korman Signs $ 48.70 | $ 2951 $ 2951 $ 2951 $ 2951 $ 2951 $ 2.95
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:

FAX: 75

757.926.8721
7.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 52 53 54 55 56 57 58
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 2343 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 14.06 | $ 18.74 | $ 1874 | $ 18.74
Garden State Highway Products $ 209 | $ 1291 $ 1291$ 129 $ 1631|$ 1631|$ 1.63
Vulcan Signs $ 5201 % 2411 $ 2411 $ 2411 $ 282 1% 282 1% 2.82
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 9.64 | $ 723 |% 723 |% 723 |% 9.64 | $ 9.64 | $ 9.64
Korman Signs $ 6.70 | $ 310 $ 3101 $ 310 $ 350 | % 350|$ 3.50
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:

FAX: 75

757.926.8721
7.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 59 60 61 62 63 64 65
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 1874 | $ 597.00 | $ 89550 ($ 1,49250($ 1,791.00| $ 2,388.00 | $ 1,530.00
Garden State Highway Products $ 163|$ 658.42 | $ 987.63|$ 1646.05|% 1,975.26|$ 2,633.68 | $ 1,669.73
Vulcan Signs $ 282 1% 645.00 | $ 96750 [$ 1,61250($ 1,935.00 | $ 2,580.00 | $ 1,635.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 9.63 | % 633.00 | $ 949.00 [ $ 1,582.00|$% 1,899.00 | $ 2,532.00 | $ 1,608.00
Korman Signs $ 350 (9% 699.00 [ $ 1,04800|% 1,747.00|$ 2,097.00 | $ 2,796.00 | $ 1,762.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:

FAX: 75

757.926.8721
7.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 66 67 68 69 70 71 72 73
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
3M Company $ 122400|$ 1,836.00|$ 2,448.00| $ 44775 | $ 597.00 | $ 89550 |$ 1,194.00|$ 1,492.50
Garden State Highway Products $ 1,335.78|$% 2,00368|% 2,671.57|$ 493.81 | $ 658.42 | $ 987.63|$ 1,316.83|$ 1,646.05
Vulcan Signs $ 1,30800|$% 1,962.00|% 2,616.00 | $ 483.75 | $ 645.00 | $ 96750 | $ 1,290.00|$ 1,612.50
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 1,287.00|$% 1,930.00|% 2,574.00|$ 474.00 | $ 633.00 | $ 949.00 | $ 1,266.00 | $ 1,582.00
Korman Signs $ 1,41000|$% 2,11500| % 2,820.00 | $ 524.00 | $ 699.00|$ 1,048.00]|% 1,398.00|$ 1,747.00
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CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID 74 75 TOTAL BID
American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. NB NB $ 18,545.54
3M Company $ 1,791.00 | $ 1,224.00 | $ 106,754.18
Garden State Highway Products $ 197526 $ 133578 | $ 81,626.81
Vulcan Signs $ 1,93500|% 1,308.00($ 82,119.10
Osburn Associates, Inc. $ 1,899.00 [$ 1,287.00 | $ 93,579.60
Korman Signs $ 2,097.00|$ 1,278.00($ 85,000.20
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