
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening:  May 25, 2010

DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time: 3:00 P.M.

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: _____________

RECORDER: _________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

              IFB #2010-6358-2011

                      

          WINDSOR GREAT PARK FLOOD CONVEYANCE PROJECT

                                             

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc 15,000.00$   9,000.00$               15,000.00$      2.00$                30.00$              35.00$            

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC 24,500.00$   15,000.00$             7,575.00$        1.85$                41.00$              25.25$            

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC 13,112.23$   6,755.50$               11,369.65$      1.43$                24.81$              27.32$            

4 J. Sanders Construction Co 15,000.00$   10,200.00$             7,500.00$        1.00$                112.00$            20.00$            

5 Ultra Services, Inc. 30,000.00$   21,000.00$             35,000.00$      0.10$                40.00$              40.00$            

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental 49,674.00$   8,500.00$               6,400.00$        2.00$                4.50$                21.00$            
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TALLY SHEET 1



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

7 8 9 10 11 12

25.00$             25.00$               2,000.00$           2,000.00$         2,000.00$       2,000.00$       

7.00$               7.50$                 931.00$              2,171.00$         2,902.00$       1,915.00$       

20.10$             1.15$                 3,148.07$           3,389.41$         2,919.50$       1,978.23$       

18.00$             15.00$               2,000.00$           3,500.00$         3,500.00$       3,500.00$       

20.00$             1.00$                 2,000.00$           3,000.00$         3,000.00$       4,000.00$       

7.00$               2.00$                 2,261.50$           3,240.25$         3,487.00$       1,672.50$       

TALLY SHEET 2



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

13 14 15 16 17 18 19

12,000.00$      4,000.00$      4,000.00$        4,500.00$         1.00$               4.00$             5.00$               

8,113.00$        430.00$         2,514.00$        9,416.00$         2.60$               4.00$             2.60$               

5,968.69$        1,040.06$      2,350.62$        1,832.00$         1.72$               2.19$             1.18$               

7,500.00$        1,000.00$      1,500.00$        1,500.00$         2.00$               3.00$             2.00$               

5,000.00$        600.00$         1,200.00$        1.00$                0.40$               3.00$             1.50$               

4,392.50$        4,244.20$      4,800.00$        10,000.00$       2.25$               3.50$             1.75$               

TALLY SHEET 3



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

20 21 22 23 24 25

9,000.00$          10.00$            4,000.00$          1,500.00$          1,000.00$          2.00$               

12,335.00$       2.25$              2,790.00$          121.00$             3,826.00$          0.53$               

3,922.45$          1.01$              635.30$             68.70$               1,030.50$          0.24$               

5,000.00$          4.00$              1,500.00$          1,000.00$          1,500.00$          1.00$               

500.00$             0.10$              0.10$                 500.00$             300.00$             0.20$               

3,000.00$          11.50$            2,500.00$          250.00$             500.00$             1.34$               

TALLY SHEET 4



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

26 27 28 29 30 31

3,000.00$        4,000.00$          20.00$              20.00$              20.00$             20.00$           

3,724.00$        4,655.00$          5.00$                16.80$              8.00$               16.80$           

1,923.60$        1,553.31$          1.50$                6.01$                1.50$               6.01$             

2,000.00$        5,000.00$          25.00$              25.00$              25.00$             25.00$           

600.00$            600.00$             12.00$              21.00$              12.00$             21.00$           

3,000.00$        3,000.00$          5.50$                40.70$              5.50$               40.70$           

TALLY SHEET 5



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

32 33 34 35 36 37

20.00$                 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              20.00$             20.00$              

63.00$                 4.90$                16.80$              5.25$                20.30$             4.90$                

20.44$                 1.50$                6.01$                1.50$                6.01$               1.50$                

250.00$               25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              25.00$             25.00$              

66.00$                 12.00$              21.00$              12.00$              21.00$             12.00$              

302.50$               5.50$                40.70$              5.50$                40.70$             5.50$                

TALLY SHEET 6



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

38 39 40 41 42 43 44

20.00$            20.00$            20.00$           20.00$          20.00$           20.00$          20.00$         

16.80$            63.00$            4.50$             19.60$          6.00$             19.60$          63.00$         

6.01$               20.44$            1.50$             6.01$            1.50$             6.01$            20.44$         

25.00$            250.00$          25.00$           25.00$          25.00$           25.00$          250.00$       

21.00$            66.00$            12.00$           21.00$          12.00$           21.00$          66.00$         

40.70$            302.50$          5.50$             40.70$          5.50$             40.70$          302.50$       

TALLY SHEET 7



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

45 46 47 48 49 50 51

20.00$           20.00$        20.00$           20.00$           20.00$            20.00$         20.00$         

5.20$             16.80$        8.40$             18.00$           6.00$              20.00$         11.20$         

1.50$             6.01$          1.50$             6.01$             1.50$              6.01$           1.50$           

25.00$           25.00$        25.00$           25.00$           25.00$            25.00$         25.00$         

112.00$         21.00$        12.00$           21.00$           12.00$            21.00$         12.00$         

5.50$             40.70$        5.50$             40.70$           5.50$              40.70$         5.50$           

TALLY SHEET 8



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

52 53 54 55 56 57 58

20.00$         20.00$         20.00$         20.00$         20.00$         20.00$         20.00$           

23.80$         11.20$         20.00$         8.00$           22.40$         7.00$           16.80$           

6.01$           1.50$           6.01$           1.50$           6.01$           1.50$           6.01$             

25.00$         25.00$         25.00$         25.00$         25.00$         25.00$         25.00$           

21.00$         12.00$         21.00$         12.00$         21.00$         12.00$         21.00$           

40.70$         5.50$           40.70$         5.50$           40.70$         5.50$           40.70$           

TALLY SHEET 9



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

59 60 61 62 63 64 65

20.00$               20.00$         20.00$         20.00$         20.00$           20.00$              20.00$         

5.60$                 16.80$         8.00$           18.00$         5.00$             18.00$              5.60$           

1.50$                 6.01$           1.50$           6.01$           1.50$             6.01$                1.50$           

25.00$               25.00$         25.00$         25.00$         25.00$           25.00$              25.00$         

12.00$               21.00$         12.00$         21.00$         12.00$           21.00$              12.00$         

5.50$                 40.70$         5.50$           40.70$         5.50$             40.70$              5.50$           

TALLY SHEET 10



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS

DEPT. OF PURCHASING

PHONE:757.926.8721

FAX: 757.926.8038

                      

          

VENDOR NAME NO BID

1 Annex General Contracts, Inc

2 Environmental Quality Resources, LLC

3 Henry S. Branscome LLC

4 J. Sanders Construction Co

5 Ultra Services, Inc.

6 HGS, LLC dba Angler Environmental

7

8

9

10

66 67 68 69 TOTAL BID

20.00$         2.00$              5,000.00$    2.00$           417,070.00$        

16.80$         4.00$              4,550.00$    2.80$           360,871.85$        

6.01$           1.50$              2,290.00$    2.29$           258,457.66$        

25.00$         25.00$            5,000.00$    5.00$           601,476.00$        

21.00$         9.00$              6,000.00$    0.10$           385,534.90$        

40.70$         4.25$              7,100.00$    6.00$           313,425.60$        

TALLY SHEET 11


