
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening:  May 25, 2010
DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time: 2:00 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: _____________

RECORDER: _________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

              IFB #2010-6285-2011
                 
          2010 RESIDENTIAL STREET RESURFACING PROGRAM

                                             

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC 67.25$           1.10$        66.60$             59.00$      54.90$              80.00$            40.00$             
2 Branscome, Inc. 56.51$           1.02$        56.51$             60.00$      48.40$              30.00$            25.00$             
3
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TALLY SHEET 1



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
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8 9 10 11 12 13 14
54.90$           47.00$       315.00$      265.00$          175.00$          80.00$             65.20$           
52.00$           30.00$       275.00$      375.00$          225.00$          100.00$           100.00$         

TALLY SHEET 2



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
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15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23
0.37$      1.10$         58.20$         2.50$         0.56$      56.40$        79.00$      25.40$      1.20$          
0.36$      0.52$         49.70$         2.42$         0.79$      52.50$        79.00$      32.00$      1.32$          

TALLY SHEET 3



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
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24 25 26 27 28 29 30 31
12.40$      26,000.00$      564.00$         1,070.00$          87.60$          49.30$       26.70$     26.20$        
11.55$      520.00$           1,600.00$      100.00$             50.00$          49.92$       23.64$     30.74$        

TALLY SHEET 4



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
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10

32 33 34 35 36 37 38 39
15.70$        8.00$       43.30$      1.50$     27.70$       71.40$        1,170.00$       1,130.00$       
14.75$        5.77$       32.50$      2.67$     18.86$       57.96$        1,543.12$       3,180.61$       

TALLY SHEET 5



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10

40 41 42 43 44 45 46 47
7,870.00$      2,350.00$     45.50$        62.70$          1,180.00$    8.50$      37.00$        57.00$       

16,000.00$    4,604.33$     35.13$        59.43$          800.00$       52.70$    89.16$        89.61$       

TALLY SHEET 6



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10

48 49 50 51 52 53 54 55
54.80$           45.60$         1,100.00$    1,260.00$    36.70$       10,000.00$    1,920.00$    62.60$        
64.81$           57.54$         2,320.50$    1,684.38$    26.51$       16,199.35$    1,590.30$    57.42$        

TALLY SHEET 7



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Basic Construction Company, LLC
2 Branscome, Inc.
3
4
5
6
7
8
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TOTAL BID
3,661,929.40$     
3,261,863.47$     

TALLY SHEET 8


