
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening:  October  27, 2009
DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time: 3:30 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: _____________

RECORDER: _________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

              IFB #2010-2879-1905

          City of Newport News City Roanoke Ave. 
Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation, Phase III-A and III-B

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc. 9,000.00 8,100.00 8,125.00 124,000.00 25,200.00 23,400.00 24,480.00 24,640.00
2 Basic Construction 6,829.20 9,863.10 7,144.15 21,154.40 29,044.40 31,398.00 43,167.60 22,419.60
3 W. R. Hall, Inc. 10,800.00 11,700.00 10,400.00 46,500.00 33,000.00 25,500.00 28,080.00 24,640.00
4 Inner-View, LTD 13,500.00 15,750.00 13,975.00 46,500.00 33,000.00 22,500.00 32,400.00 25,200.00
5 WB&E Construction , Inc. 10,559.40 9,747.00 5,279.30 13,987.20 19,060.80 14,349.00 18,842.40 16,172.80
6 VICO Construction Corp. 10,224.00 12,501.00 11,810.50 25,203.00 15,532.00 12,480.00 18,468.00 14,420.00
7 Precon Construction Co. 12,871.20 28,013.40 13,838.50 24,269.90 26,021.60 18,498.00 27,111.60 20,157.20
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc. 30,000.00 36,000.00 26,000.00 60,450.00 35,200.00 30,000.00 28,800.00 28,000.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16
38,480.00 65,280.00 28,120.00 29,520.00 5,100.00 4,200.00 10,000.00 5,500.00
76,434.60 99,177.60 62,768.40 59,446.80 9,688.30 10,172.64 10,537.60 10,007.60
51,800.00 81,600.00 28,500.00 31,680.00 3,400.00 2,520.00 4,800.00 2,800.00
55,500.00 76,800.00 36,100.00 34,200.00 8,075.00 9,000.00 14,400.00 11,000.00
38,731.60 50,246.40 19,380.00 19,818.00 1,841.10 2,924.04 3,429.60 4,422.20
24,864.00 32,160.00 17,746.00 19,224.00 10,123.50 8,443.20 6,516.00 4,754.00
43,785.80 54,336.00 27,261.20 25,657.20 5,203.87 7,345.32 9,513.00 9,678.80
59,200.00 96,000.00 30,400.00 36,000.00 8,500.00 7,200.00 20,000.00 16,000.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24
16,800.00 40.95 4,000.00 6,000.00 10,000.00 34.80 11,200.00 15,600.00
24,205.44 6,470.10 10,702.80 6,585.00 3,492.61 59,020.80 18,336.50 18,861.60
34,160.00 2,047.50 9,600.00 6,000.00 3,000.00 97,440.00 7,700.00 10,800.00
20,720.00 12,285.00 16,000.00 10,000.00 3,500.00 34.80 12,250.00 18,000.00
18,699.52 3,685.50 3,610.00 2,707.52 2,256.25 37,688.40 17,374.00 18,410.40
36,108.80 43,816.50 7,854.40 6,314.80 21,243.00 114,840.00 11,235.00 19,608.00
23,517.76 2,047.50 4,455.68 2,673.68 500.00 83,067.60 9,842.00 19,852.80
22,400.00 20,475.00 8,000.00 6,000.00 3,000.00 69,600.00 10,500.00 14,400.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

25 26 27 28 29 30 31 32
22,620.00 36,900.00 5.40 7,852.00 11,778.00 29,082.00 6,050.00 800.00
13,531.40 40,348.10 34,570.80 8,480.16 12,327.64 33,970.92 3,509.00 202.64
20,300.00 61,500.00 27,000.00 7,852.00 11,778.00 29,868.00 2,420.00 800.00

5.80 4.10 5.40 11,778.00 11,778.00 31,440.00 9,680.00 3,600.00
14,656.60 30,713.10 486.00 3,533.40 3,533.40 31,919.46 1,089.00 541.52
20,822.00 38,991.00 40,662.00 7,066.80 10,206.60 109,961.40 91,960.00 1,536.80
15,480.20 46,166.00 42,870.60 8,244.60 11,974.30 33,012.00 3,303.30 773.36
20,300.00 41,000.00 21,600.00 11,778.00 11,778.00 39,300.00 18,150.00 400.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

33 34 35 36 37 38 39
1,860.00 14,240.00 8,000.00 10,500.00 15,400.00 0.01 728.00
1,283.40 26,206.05 7,508.70 18,336.50 27,506.50 28,855.59 15,143.44
4,650.00 13,350.00 7,500.00 11,200.00 24,500.00 20,000.00 780.00
4,650.00 13,350.00 52,500.00 12,250.00 33,250.00 7,500.00 2,600.00
5,040.60 11,245.15 37,905.00 7,896.00 11,056.50 902.50 1,759.94
4,464.00 15,754.00 168,754.20 20,440.00 23,450.00 67,629.00 715.00
1,897.20 11,877.05 5,044.47 861.50 33,404.00 3,181.42 827.32
3,720.00 13,350.00 10,000.00 17,500.00 17,500.00 30,000.00 2,600.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

40 41 42 43 44 45 46
32,400.00 6,000.00 1,000.00 2,400.00 10,500.00 10,500.00 10,500.00
57,880.17 3,567.60 713.52 1,645.44 12,787.80 11,989.80 8,398.20
24,300.00 5,000.00 220.00 270.00 8,700.00 7,800.00 7,800.00

0.81 0.10 1,970.00 5,400.00 9,000.00 9,000.00 9,000.00
9,137.61 1,500.00 225.62 676.86 3,841.80 2,869.80 2,974.40

69,441.30 6,900.00 204.80 248.40 5,598.00 5,844.00 5,388.00
17,669.34 2,676.90 246.88 290.16 10,960.20 9,538.80 9,145.20
16,200.00 3,000.00 600.00 1,500.00 4,800.00 4,200.00 3,900.00



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Tidewater Utility Const. Inc.
2 Basic Construction
3 W. R. Hall, Inc.
4 Inner-View, LTD
5 WB&E Construction , Inc.
6 VICO Construction Corp.
7 Precon Construction Co.
8 Walter C. Via Enterprises, Inc.

47 48 49 50 51 52 Total
6,000.00 6,000.00 23,400.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 7,500.00 787,156.16$                        
2,732.40 2,606.40 21,806.20 1,052.40 1,828.40 3,567.60 1,059,285.61$                     
2,400.00 2,400.00 26,000.00 2,000.00 4,000.00 2,250.00 905,105.50$                        
3,000.00 3,000.00 39,000.00 3,000.00 6,000.00 6,250.00 829,702.01$                        

635.80 523.40 5,397.60 325.00 541.60 2,030.65 546,184.74$                        
1,604.00 1,394.00 16,692.00 1,172.00 2,080.00 3,535.00 1,248,004.00$                     
3,503.40 3,361.80 35,110.40 3,114.60 4,977.60 2,230.40 829,043.21$                        
1,200.00 1,000.00 11,700.00 800.00 1,200.00 5,000.00 1,016,201.00$                     


