
.
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening :  September 8, 2009
DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time:  2:15 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: _____________

RECORDER: _________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

                                 IFB #2010-2154-0211
                  
                                   Hydrant Repair Parts for the

                                           Department of Public Utilities
                                                       Waterworks

Item H D Supply Waterworks
1 NO BID
2 NO BID
3 NO BID
4 NO BID
5 NO BID
6 NO BID
7 NO BID
8 NO BID
9 NO BID
10 NO BID
11 NO BID
12 NO BID
13 NO BID
14 NO BID
15 NO BID
16 NO BID
17 NO BID
18 NO BID
19 NO BID
20 NO BID
21 NO BID
22 NO BID
23 NO BID

TALLY SHEET 1



Item H D Supply Waterworks

24 NO BID
25 NO BID
26 NO BID
27 NO BID
28 NO BID
29 NO BID
30 NO BID
31 NO BID
32 NO BID
33 NO BID
34 NO BID
35 NO BID
36 NO BID
37 NO BID
38 NO BID
39 NO BID
40 NO BID
41 NO BID
42 NO BID
43 NO BID
44 NO BID
45 NO BID
46 NO BID
47 NO BID
48 NO BID
49 NO BID
50 NO BID
51 NO BID
52 NO BID
53 NO BID
54 NO BID
55 NO BID
56 NO BID
57 NO BID
58 NO BID
59 NO BID
60 NO BID
61 NO BID
62 NO BID
63 NO BID
64 NO BID
65 NO BID
66 NO BID
67 NO BID
68 NO BID
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Item H D Supply Waterworks

69 NO BID
70 NO BID
71 NO BID
72 NO BID
73 NO BID
74 NO BID
75 NO BID
76 NO BID
77 NO BID
78 NO BID
79 NO BID
80 NO BID
81 NO BID
82 NO BID
83 NO BID
84 NO BID
85 NO BID
86 NO BID
87 NO BID
88 NO BID
89 NO BID
90 NO BID
91 NO BID
92 NO BID
93 NO BID
94 NO BID
95 NO BID
96 NO BID
97 NO BID
98 NO BID
99 NO BID

100 NO BID
101 NO BID
102 NO BID
103 NO BID
104 NO BID
105 NO BID
106 NO BID
107 NO BID
108 NO BID
109 NO BID
110 NO BID
111 NO BID
112 NO BID

TALLY SHEET 3



    A. P. SMITH PARTS

ITEM H. D. Waterwork Supply
1 259.16$                              
2 373.78$                              
3 31.38$                                
4 133.20$                              
5 133.20$                              
6 184.80$                              
7 184.80$                              
8 7.23$                                  
9 456.12$                              

10 19.62$                                
11 18.08$                                
12 18.22$                                
13 18.22$                                
14 4.63$                                  
15 22.72$                                
16 -
17 33.75$                                
18 24.58$                                
19 9.29$                                  
20 8.47$                                  
21 33.80$                                
22 1.78$                                  
23 -
24 2.26$                                  
25 48.95$                                
26 153.58$                              
27 94.70$                                
28 51.63$                                
29 51.63$                                
30 8.95$                                  
31 2.20$                                  
32 11.30$                                
33 -
34 2.20$                                  
35 2.12$                                  
36 6.56$                                  
37 128.03$                              
38 4.65$                                  
39 9.95$                                  
40 189.99$                              
41 -
42 180.69$                              
43 185.35$                              
44 199.28$                              
45 78.15$                                
46 -
47 18.35$                                
48 22.25$                                



49 26.07$                                
50 29.95$                                
51 1.78$                                  
52 1.78$                                  
53 -
54 156.94$                              
55 -
56 33.77$                                
57 3.47$                                  
58 2.99$                                  
59 140.42$                              


