
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS BID OPENING:  AUG. 25, 2009 
DEPT. OF PURCHASING TIME:   2:30 P. M.  
PHONE:757.926.8721 BUYER: __________________
FAX: 757.926.8038 RECORDER:______________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made determinations that any
bids meet the requirements, and makes no claim that these are anything other than the
prices entered and read aloud at the public bid opening.

                                                                                IFB #2010-0305-0911

                                                               SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE

VENDOR NAME 15,000 GAL. 600,000 GAL TOTAL BID
1 Jones Chemical, Inc. No Bid 0.79$               474,000.00$    
2 Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc. No Bid 0.95$               570,000.00$    
3 Water Guard, Inc. 0.99$               0.82$               506,775.00$    
4 Dominion Chemical Company 1.10$               No Bid 16,500.00$      
5 Brenntag Southeast No Bid No BId
6 Univar 2.18$               0.62$               401,700.00$    
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Terms
Jones Chemicals, Inc. 2%10N30
Kuehne Chemcial Co., Inc. N30
Water Guard, Inc. 2%10N30
Dominion Chemical Company N30
Brenntag Southeast 2%10N30
Univar N30


