
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS BID OPENING: March 25, 2008
DEPT. OF PURCHASING TIME: 4:00 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: ____________________________

RECORDER: ________________________

IFB 2008-81414-0805
                          Sale of Surplus

Trucks and Equipment

                                    

VENDOR NAME NO BID ITEM 1684 ITEM 1690 ITEM 1691 ITEM  1698
1 Jeff Norfleet
2 Ruben Farless
3 W. E. Whatley
4 Kris K & Williams J Snyder
5 Richard M Dore 2,011.11$       2,011.11$     2,011.11$     2,011.11$     
6 Charles Sibley 2,500.00$       2,500.00$     2,500.00$     2,500.00$     
7 Auto Wholesalers 21,777.00$     16,777.00$   17,777.00$   21,777.00$   
8 Bill Fary Ford, Inc. 7,000.00$     
9 John C. Holland Enterprises 2,222.22$       2,222.22$     2,222.22$     2,222.22$     
10 Nathan Tatum
11 Tom's Truck Sales, LLC 23,557.00$     20,567.00$   23,557.00$   23,890.00$   
12 James Washington III 7,000.00$       7,000.00$     7,000.00$     7,000.00$     
13
14
15

TALLY SHEET 1



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                  

                                    

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Jeff Norfleet
2 Ruben Farless
3 W. E. Whatley
4 Kris K & Williams J Snyder
5 Richard M Dore
6 Charles Sibley
7 Auto Wholesalers
8 Bill Fary Ford, Inc.
9 John C. Holland Enterprises
10 Nathan Tatum
11 Tom's Truck Sales, LLC
12 James Washington III
13
14
15

ITEM 909 ITEM 1044 ITEM 0009 ITEM 1820

4,110.00$    
16,650.00$    

7,510.10$      5,510.10$     
2,111.11$      2,111.11$     487.87$      487.87$       
3,000.00$      3,000.00$     1,500.00$   2,000.00$    

15,777.00$   
4,000.00$      2,800.00$   5,500.00$    
2,727.27$      2,727.27$     1,414.14$   1,414.14$    

7,160.00$      9,140.00$     841.00$      820.00$       
6,000.00$      6,000.00$     700.01$      700.01$       

TALLY SHEET 2



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                  

                                    

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Jeff Norfleet
2 Ruben Farless
3 W. E. Whatley
4 Kris K & Williams J Snyder
5 Richard M Dore
6 Charles Sibley
7 Auto Wholesalers
8 Bill Fary Ford, Inc.
9 John C. Holland Enterprises
10 Nathan Tatum
11 Tom's Truck Sales, LLC
12 James Washington III
13
14
15

ITEM 1460 ITEM 2544 ITEM 1703 ITEM 2013
8,236.00$     

5,601.00$     
7,500.00$     
3,510.10$     

487.87$       2,111.11$     2,111.11$     2,111.11$     
2,000.00$    4,000.00$     5,000.00$     3,000.00$     

13,000.00$   12,500.00$   10,500.00$   
1,414.14$    1,456.56$     1,456.56$     1,456.56$     
4,000.90$    9,500.90$     8,500.90$     5,500.90$     
3,700.00$    11,860.00$   5,260.00$     3,761.00$     

12,001.01$   8,000.01$     6,500.00$     

TALLY SHEET 3



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                  

                                    

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Jeff Norfleet
2 Ruben Farless
3 W. E. Whatley
4 Kris K & Williams J Snyder
5 Richard M Dore
6 Charles Sibley
7 Auto Wholesalers
8 Bill Fary Ford, Inc.
9 John C. Holland Enterprises
10 Nathan Tatum
11 Tom's Truck Sales, LLC
12 James Washington III
13
14
15

ITEM 0013 ITEM 604 ITEM 605 ITEM 181 ITEM 190
1,636.00$    

1,111.11$    2,537.37$     737.37$       2,580.88$    500.00$      
3,000.00$    2,000.00$     2,000.00$    3,000.00$    3,000.00$   

3,200.00$    6,000.00$    2,500.00$   
1,414.14$     2,222.22$    

521.00$       752.00$        640.00$       640.00$       256.00$      
601.00$       1,001.00$   

TALLY SHEET 4



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                  

                                    

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Jeff Norfleet
2 Ruben Farless
3 W. E. Whatley
4 Kris K & Williams J Snyder
5 Richard M Dore
6 Charles Sibley
7 Auto Wholesalers
8 Bill Fary Ford, Inc.
9 John C. Holland Enterprises
10 Nathan Tatum
11 Tom's Truck Sales, LLC
12 James Washington III
13
14
15

ITEM 1208 ITEM 854 ITEM 1734 ITEM 1994

500.00$       500.00$      500.00$       500.00$      
2,000.00$    1,500.00$   1,500.00$    

2,500.00$    
666.66$      

460.00$       260.00$      521.00$       215.00$      
1,001.00$    800.00$      900.00$       

TALLY SHEET 5


