
City of Newport News IFB #2008-77694-0211
Purchasing Department Bid Due Date: Aug. 21, 2007 3:00 P. M.
Phone (757) 926-8721 Buyer______________________
Fax (757) 926-8038

Assis. Buyer________________

WATER METERS
VENDORS

Estimated Badger Meter, Inc. Hersey Meters Sensus Meter. Syst.
ITEM # Annual Quantity U. Price U. Price U. Price

1 10,000 31.00$    33.00$   No Bid
2 100 31.00$    33.00$   
3 500 55.00$    57.00$   
4 750 76.00$    72.00$   
5 750 206.00$  245.00$ 
6 750 310.00$  313.00$ 
7 10,000 No Bid 33.00$   
8 100 No Bid 33.00$   
9 500 No Bid 57.00$   
10 750 No Bid 72.00$   
11 750 No Bid 245.00$ 
12 750 No Bid 313.00$ 
13 10,000 2.20$      1.50$     
14 100 2.20$      1.50$     
15 500 3.30$      2.00$     
16 750 5.50$      3.00$     
17 750 9.90$      6.00$     
18 750 14.30$    8.00$     

VENDORS

Estimated Elster AMCO Water Neptune Tech
ITEM # Annual Quantity U. Price U. Price U. Price

1 10,000 36.80$    29.90$   
2 100 36.82$    29.90$   
3 500 48.91$    47.75$   
4 750 79.15$    79.50$   
5 750 288.25$  195.00$ 
6 750 353.29$  252.00$ 
7 10,000 36.80$    No Bid
8 100 36.82$    No Bid
9 500 48.91$    No Bid
10 750 79.15$    No Bid
11 750 288.25$  No Bid
12 750 353.29$  No Bid
13 10,000 2.50$      2.00$     
14 100 2.50$      2.00$     
15 500 3.50$      3.00$     
16 750 7.00$      5.00$     
17 750 15.00$    7.00$     
18 750 20.00$    9.00$     




