
CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS Bid Opening:  May 4, 2010
DEPT. OF PURCHASING Time: 2:30 P.M.
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038 BUYER: _____________

RECORDER: _________

The City has not checked the tabulations for errors or made

determinations that any bids meet the requirements, and makes no

claim that these are anything other than the prices entered and 

read aloud at the public bid opening.

              IFB #2010-5699-2012
                 
                     Newport News Richneck Rd Improvements-Phase I

                                             VDOT Project Number: U000-121-R84, PE-101, M-501

VENDOR NAME NO BID 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
1 Precon Construction Co. 750.00$         125,000.00$           20,000.00$      35,000.00$      10,000.00$       16,000.00$     16,000.00$      
2 Branscome, Inc. 1,227.42$      222,268.65$           43,923.30$      138,069.72$    22,584.74$       75,768.46$     15,462.95$      
3 Suburban Grading & Util 575.00$         116,100.00$           12,900.00$      29,000.00$      5,060.00$         87,615.00$     10,200.00$      
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc. 1,425.00$      194,800.00$           25,000.00$      67,000.00$      24,500.00$       150,000.00$   32,000.00$      
5 E.V. Williams, Inc 1,927.68$      159,587.92$           16,686.42$      118,927.15$    23,493.03$       77,514.18$     23,408.53$      
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC 289.00$         99,300.00$             20,400.00$      51,300.00$      12,900.00$       104,000.00$   17,100.00$      
7 Tidewater Utility Const. 1,000.00$      95,000.00$             5,000.00$        75,000.00$      10,000.00$       150,000.00$   2,000.00$        
8
9

10

TALLY SHEET 1



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

8 9 10 11 12 13 14 15
175,000.00$      12,750.00$         35,000.00$       22,500.00$     21,500.00$     86.75$             58.00$           59.00$              
410,000.00$      69,000.00$         41,756.04$       6,577.31$       24,407.76$     127.68$           88.27$           63.47$              
256,600.00$      28,416.00$         23,130.00$       2,300.00$       13,248.00$     125.00$           96.00$           96.00$              
437,000.00$      53,300.00$         56,000.00$       10,000.00$     46,800.00$     110.00$           62.00$           68.00$              
193,000.00$      16,865.08$         243,681.80$     17,716.88$     10,401.15$     70.89$             46.49$           46.81$              
355,000.00$      26,700.00$         33,000.00$       2,380.00$       15,100.00$     128.00$           49.70$           62.70$              
300,000.00$      5,000.00$           140,000.00$     2,000.00$       125,000.00$   170.00$           89.00$           91.00$              

TALLY SHEET 2



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23
62.25$              63.75$             262.00$         5,325.00$        100.00$             3,075.00$       5,125.00$          4,900.00$          
71.48$              80.04$             218.20$         4,641.07$        124.47$             2,260.12$       4,394.68$          4,269.11$          

100.00$            104.00$           255.00$         5,150.00$        69.00$               3,090.00$       5,079.00$          4,888.00$          
67.00$              80.00$             432.00$         7,440.00$        80.00$               2,700.00$       3,600.00$          4,000.00$          
51.40$              64.18$             216.90$         1,661.40$        87.33$               2,474.95$       3,513.33$          3,156.28$          
54.10$              114.00$           283.00$         7,380.00$        61.30$               3,210.00$       4,520.00$          4,110.00$          
95.00$              195.00$           325.00$         3,900.00$        90.00$               3,800.00$       5,200.00$          4,500.00$          

TALLY SHEET 3



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

24 25 26 27 28 29 30 31
4,375.00$          4,750.00$        8,800.00$        5,300.00$          8,975.00$        3,425.00$        3,750.00$        3,250.00$      
3,264.62$          4,269.11$        8,161.54$        9,417.16$          9,793.85$        2,762.37$        3,766.87$        2,260.12$      
4,370.00$          4,664.00$        8,755.00$        5,295.00$          8,860.00$        3,392.00$        3,738.00$        3,212.00$      
4,500.00$          4,000.00$        6,900.00$        4,050.00$          8,100.00$        3,950.00$        4,200.00$        4,200.00$      
3,439.62$          3,322.05$        6,046.52$        4,289.71$          8,426.66$        2,645.31$        2,879.74$        2,385.55$      
4,440.00$          4,300.00$        7,450.00$        6,660.00$          10,200.00$      3,070.00$        3,240.00$        2,770.00$      
5,200.00$          5,200.00$        9,000.00$        2,500.00$          14,000.00$      3,800.00$        4,200.00$        3,800.00$      

TALLY SHEET 4



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

32 33 34 35 36 37 38
4,150.00$            3,500.00$        3,675.00$         3,925.00$        1,125.00$        1,750.00$         2,700.00$       
4,394.68$            4,017.99$        3,766.87$         4,017.99$        775.17$           796.18$            3,766.87$       
4,096.00$            3,467.00$        3,632.00$         3,851.00$        908.00$           2,257.00$         3,031.00$       
4,500.00$            3,500.00$        3,500.00$         3,800.00$        540.00$           2,300.00$         3,100.00$       
3,008.93$            3,014.61$        2,571.78$         3,102.46$        754.03$           1,248.20$         2,588.71$       
3,840.00$            5,220.00$        3,360.00$         3,940.00$        677.00$           2,300.00$         3,610.00$       
4,400.00$            5,200.00$        4,200.00$         4,700.00$        680.00$           1,600.00$         4,800.00$       

TALLY SHEET 5



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

39 40 41 42 43 44 45 46
5,000.00$       1,375.00$      95.00$          18.50$           15.25$          16.25$         1,175.00$      86.50$        
3,766.87$       3,139.05$      42.00$          13.66$           13.14$          13.14$         716.45$         71.95$        
5,317.00$       2,550.00$      14.00$          18.00$           17.00$          17.00$         1,677.00$      81.00$        
6,200.00$       2,200.00$      13.00$          15.50$           14.50$          15.00$         925.00$         76.00$        
2,588.71$       1,406.44$      10.85$          16.72$           14.65$          15.14$         809.39$         68.25$        
6,010.00$       2,030.00$      9.30$            24.50$           18.20$          19.80$         1,340.00$      77.50$        
9,000.00$       1,500.00$      32.00$          16.50$           15.80$          21.00$         780.00$         86.00$        

TALLY SHEET 6



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

47 48 49 50 51 52 53 54 55
75.50$           28.25$           28.25$            43.25$         4.50$           75.00$         3.75$           7.50$           29.00$         
63.17$           24.91$           25.65$            28.34$         2.24$           35.25$         3.47$           6.60$           28.86$         
67.25$           24.00$           25.00$            38.75$         3.50$           26.50$         8.50$           7.50$           35.00$         
68.50$           25.50$           28.50$            36.00$         2.50$           60.00$         7.00$           7.50$           33.00$         
59.87$           20.69$           21.24$            29.48$         3.42$           34.12$         2.75$           5.62$           31.32$         
69.20$           30.40$           35.00$            39.20$         3.20$           41.20$         8.10$           7.00$           31.00$         
75.00$           50.00$           50.00$            50.00$         3.75$           45.00$         3.45$           6.80$           37.00$         

TALLY SHEET 7



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

56 57 58 59 60 61 62 63
46.50$         44.25$         15.50$           29.00$               6.75$           165.00$       49.75$         425.00$         
41.23$         41.23$         28.94$           17.71$               5.25$           128.24$       35.05$         515.43$         
50.50$         42.50$         19.00$           33.00$               6.00$           138.00$       38.50$         588.75$         
46.00$         53.00$         12.50$           21.00$               6.00$           150.00$       42.00$         400.00$         
43.61$         43.61$         10.07$           9.95$                 5.38$           131.17$       35.85$         501.43$         
49.60$         47.20$         35.70$           48.60$               6.30$           154.00$       47.20$         719.00$         
65.00$         62.00$         22.00$           12.00$               7.50$           185.00$       50.00$         185.00$         

TALLY SHEET 8



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

64 65 66 67 68 69 70 71 72
50,000.00$       55.00$         64.00$         65.00$            92.50$         97.50$         120.00$       128.00$       1,325.00$    
42,000.00$       26.80$         34.02$         35.05$            96.72$         134.64$       110.04$       165.57$       605.07$       
30,690.00$       28.60$         36.30$         37.40$            69.00$         69.00$         88.00$         100.00$       335.00$       
20,000.00$       30.00$         37.50$         38.50$            53.00$         67.00$         80.00$         300.00$       320.00$       

8,922.62$         27.42$         34.80$         35.85$            42.84$         51.96$         69.46$         95.32$         1,239.25$    
58,000.00$       32.30$         41.00$         42.20$            113.00$       32.50$         90.10$         214.00$       701.00$       

175,000.00$     29.00$         37.00$         39.00$            61.00$         81.00$         110.00$       275.00$       1,500.00$    

TALLY SHEET 9



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

73 74 75 76 77 78 79 80 81
97.50$         1,025.00$    425.00$       4.50$           2.75$           8,000.00$    55.75$         83.50$         2,300.00$    
77.31$         1,033.67$    512.21$       3.61$           2.06$           2,525.62$    112.72$       105.03$       2,092.45$    
82.00$         287.00$       128.00$       4.00$           2.20$           2,695.00$    85.00$         125.00$       2,058.00$    
86.00$         530.00$       240.00$       4.00$           2.00$           3,000.00$    100.00$       90.00$         2,000.00$    
79.08$         995.42$       351.51$       3.69$           2.11$           7,381.07$    85.51$         92.66$         1,815.43$    
93.10$         805.00$       349.00$       4.30$           2.50$           3,040.00$    99.50$         87.00$         2,310.00$    
90.00$         800.00$       275.00$       4.00$           2.30$           2,800.00$    125.00$       120.00$       1,500.00$    

TALLY SHEET 10



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

82 83 84 85 86 87 88 89 90
825.00$       100.00$       100.00$       175.00$       70.75$         87.00$         3,550.00$    1,750.00$    1,300.00$    
872.75$       70.22$         70.22$         104.49$       96.16$         80.75$         3,714.66$    2,701.01$    1,361.55$    
583.00$       87.00$         87.00$         31.45$         88.00$         97.00$         4,181.00$    1,558.00$    1,491.00$    

1,200.00$    80.00$         80.00$         60.00$         100.00$       75.00$         3,750.00$    2,250.00$    1,250.00$    
2,002.23$    87.33$         87.33$         35.93$         61.01$         70.04$         2,932.83$    1,570.02$    1,113.93$    

584.00$       53.20$         53.20$         64.20$         64.40$         50.70$         3,850.00$    1,740.00$    1,620.00$    
500.00$       0.01$           0.01$           35.00$         200.00$       99.00$         3,750.00$    1,800.00$    1,200.00$    

TALLY SHEET 11



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

91 92 93 94 95 96 97 98 99
2,525.00$    32.50$         3.25$           1.35$           0.65$           0.50$           12.75$         175.00$       25.75$         
2,061.73$    25.26$         2.58$           1.03$           0.52$           0.37$           10.31$         128.86$       20.62$         
2,200.00$    27.00$         3.00$           2.00$           1.00$           0.40$           11.00$         137.50$       22.00$         
2,200.00$    25.00$         3.00$           1.00$           1.00$           0.40$           15.00$         140.00$       22.00$         
2,148.09$    25.78$         2.35$           1.13$           0.40$           0.40$           2.15$           139.63$       23.63$         
2,480.00$    30.40$         3.10$           1.20$           0.62$           0.45$           12.40$         155.00$       24.80$         
2,300.00$    28.00$         2.80$           1.15$           0.57$           0.40$           11.50$         143.75$       23.00$         

TALLY SHEET 12



CITY OF NEWPORT NEWS
DEPT. OF PURCHASING
PHONE:757.926.8721
FAX: 757.926.8038

                 
          

VENDOR NAME NO BID
1 Precon Construction Co.
2 Branscome, Inc.
3 Suburban Grading & Util
4 George Nice & Sons, Inc.
5 E.V. Williams, Inc
6 Basic Construction Co,LLC
7 Tidewater Utility Const.
8
9

10

TOTAL BID
3,870,929.25$     
4,146,051.07$     
3,893,577.25$     
3,994,204.00$     
3,584,855.16$     
3,726,034.70$     
4,785,860.90$     

-$                     
-$                     
-$                     

TALLY SHEET 13


